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From an extraordinary new voice in fiction comes a haunting, powerful novel about mothers and daughters,
choice and regret, the mistakes we make and the ones we hope we can correct before it's too late.

Nothing much ever happens in Falling Rock, Kentucky. So when Virginia Lemmons' husband takes off in
his Trans Am to take up with a beautician, there's not much to do but what people in rural Kentucky have
always done--get on with it. Now, overwhelmed and unsure, Virginia's got her hands full trying to keep it
together, body and soul, while raising her two teenage kids--eighteen-year-old son, Will, and her spirited
fourteen-year-old daughter, Shannon.

But Shannon has her own ideas for breaking free of Falling Rock, and in her reckless, wild-child daughter,
Virginia sees echoes of herself and her own painful past. She'll do whatever it takes to keep her daughter
from making the same tragic mistakes, and saving what's left of her fragile family just may be the biggest
fight of Virginia's life.

In this compelling, heartbreaking first novel, Janna McMahan brings to authentic life the dreams, passions,
and troubles of one southern town, where choice isn't always easy to come by, and living the hand you're
dealt with is a grace all its own.

"A beautifully wrought novel populated by a vivid cast of characters. . .Janna McMahan takes us completely
into the lives of these people and their small town, presenting this world with authenticity and dignity. I
absolutely loved this book and will carry it with me for a long time." --Silas House
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From reader reviews:

Timothy Larios:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to
take a wander, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book allowed Calling
Home? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time using your
favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have other
opinion?

Gertrude Call:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people
in the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that concern above.
Every person has distinct personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be obligated someone or
something that they don't need do that. You must know how great along with important the book Calling
Home. All type of book could you see on many methods. You can look for the internet solutions or other
social media.

Joseph Mattie:

This Calling Home book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit
you have by reading this book is usually information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get
information which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This Calling Home
without we understand teach the one who reading it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't
end up being worry Calling Home can bring whenever you are and not make your carrier space or
bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Calling
Home having excellent arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Lauren Clarke:

This Calling Home usually are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The reason why of
this Calling Home can be one of many great books you must have is usually giving you more than just
simple reading food but feed you with information that probably will shock your preceding knowledge. This
book is usually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book
and printed versions. Beside that this Calling Home giving you an enormous of experience like rich
vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that could it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and
revel in reading.
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