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The most comprehensive study of Shifu available, this valuable work explores the life and political milieu of
a central figure in Republican China. Born in 1884, Shifu was brought down in 1915 by overwork, poverty,
and tuberculosis. Yet during that short span, he became the most influential anarchist of his time. Drawing
on a wealth of primary source material, Krebs provides an intellectual biography of this committed
revolutionary and analyzes the importance of Shifu's thought during the New Culture-May Fourth years as
his followers fought for influence with the Marxists and later over the issue of alliance with the Nationalists.
Placing Shifu's life within the dynamic intellectual and political currents of the time, the author describes
Shifu's early work as an assassin within the anti-Qing movement. Examining the influence on Shifu of
Confucianism and Buddhism, Krebs highlights reform Buddhism's close relationship with revolutionary
activism. Most significantly, Shifu's unflagging work to propagate anarchism during the early years of the
Republic and his interactions with other socialists reveal a hitherto unknown level of activity among socialist
revolutionaries. This important book thus offers fresh insights not only into the anarchist movement itself,
but into the broader history of Chinese socialism as well.
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From reader reviews:

Wesley McFarland:

The book Shifu, Soul of Chinese Anarchism can give more knowledge and information about everything you
want. So why must we leave the good thing like a book Shifu, Soul of Chinese Anarchism? Some of you
have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim this book can give many information for us. It is
absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that,
you can give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Shifu, Soul of Chinese Anarchism has simple
shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by
open up and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Dale Eich:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information today can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is within the former life are hard to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen within you if you take Shifu, Soul of Chinese Anarchism as the daily
resource information.

Marc Medina:

The reserve untitled Shifu, Soul of Chinese Anarchism is the e-book that recommended to you to see. You
can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to you. The language that writer use to explained
their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of research when write
the book, and so the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could get
the e-book of Shifu, Soul of Chinese Anarchism from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy
free time.

Latricia Wynkoop:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
lots of stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to you of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading publications. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is Shifu, Soul of Chinese Anarchism.
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