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The most common phrase in print is "cover before striking," a warning to those about to innocently strike a
match to be careful not to burn their fingers.

Uppal's characters in Cover Before Striking are all people pushing their lives to new levels of intensity,
danger, or passion as they test their limits and those of the world. The pyromaniac at the heart of the title
story — winner of the Gloria Vanderbilt Short Fiction Prize — desperately uses fire to reconnect with lost
lovers and family members. In "Vertigo," an injured Olympic athlete becomes a research guinea pig in a
surreal scientific experiment. In "The Boy Next Door," a teenager recounts how her mother took her and fled
Canada for Brazil, along with the local Catholic priest.

Implacable and just a little unhinged, the stories of Cover Before Striking each move toward that moment of
contact when the sparks begin to fly, when destruction and beauty seem to blur together. With this collection,
Priscila Uppal offers the literary equivalent of playing with fire.
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From reader reviews:

Sam Stenger:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular
spare time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book
eligible Cover Before Striking? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your
time with the favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have
different opinion?

Robert Reynolds:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach,
or picnic inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something
different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your free of charge
time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to try look for book, may be the reserve untitled Cover Before Striking can be good book to read. May
be it may be best activity to you.

Mildred Yen:

Beside this kind of Cover Before Striking in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get closer to the
new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh through the oven so
don't possibly be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have
Cover Before Striking because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you
occasionally have book but you do not get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you
have this with your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring
beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book and read it from now!

William McCoy:

Guide is one of source of expertise. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen have to have book to know the upgrade information of year to be able to year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By book
Cover Before Striking we can consider more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To be creative
person must love to read a book. Just choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end up being
doubt to change your life at this book Cover Before Striking. You can more inviting than now.
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